
  
 

MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

VIA ZOOM/In Person 

Knowledge Park; 5240 Knowledge Parkway; Erie, PA 16510 

November 17, 2022 

 

ZOOM Meeting Information: 
 https://us02web.zoom.us/j/83668975821 

 

 

Meeting ID: 836 6897 5821 

Password: not required 

 

 

AGENDA 

 

1. CALL TO ORDER 

 

2. ROLL CALL 

 

3. APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

 

4. APPROVAL OF MINUTES – October 2022 

 

5. DIRECTOR’S COMMENTS 

 

6. COMMENTS BY CHAIRMAN 

 

7. PUBLIC COMMENT 

 

8. PRESENTATION 

 

9. COMMITTEE REPORTS 

 

a. Treasurer’s Report 

b. Strategic Planning Committee 

c. Update from County Council  

d. Update from County Executive’s Office 

 

10. REPORT OF THE EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR 

 

11. SOLICITOR’S REPORT 

 

12. OLD BUSINESS 

 

 

https://us02web.zoom.us/j/83668975821


 

 

13. NEW BUSINESS 

 

a. Resolution Number 13, 2022 – Resolution to extend a contract with Roth Marz 

Partnership to provide building inspections as described in the Erie County 

Community Facility Assessment Request for Proposal 

 

b. Resolution Number 14, 2022 – Resolution to enter into agreement with two (2) 

recipients of Small Business Ecosystem grant program totaling $350,000 for the 

purpose of strengthening the small business community in the wake of the COVID-

19 pandemic – Round 1 

 

 

14. ADJOURNMENT 

 

 

Next Regularly Scheduled Board Meeting of ECGRA 
 

Date:  Thursday, December 8, 2022  **PLEASE NOTE:  This is the second Tuesday! 

Time:  8:30 a.m. – BOARD Meeting 

Location: 5240 Knowledge Parkway, Erie, PA  16510; Jordan Room 

ZOOM meeting – details to follow 



 

Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority 
Minutes of the Board of Directors’ Meeting 

October 20, 2022 

 

Meetings for the Board of Directors of ECGRA can begin meeting in a physical location per 

Governor Wolf’s proclamation of June 11, 2021.  However, each member and ex-officio has 

the option to attend in person or virtually.  Members of the public can now speak at the 

physical location of 5240 Knowledge Parkway. 

 

 

CALL TO ORDER 

 

The Board of Directors’ Meeting of the Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority was held on October 

20, 2022 at 5240 Knowledge Parkway, Erie, PA 16510.  Legal Notice of the meeting was given 

through an advertisement appearing in the Erie Times-News. The meeting was called to order by the 

Chair. 

 

 

ROLL CALL 

 

Mr. Barney, Mr. Cleaver, and Mr. Oberlander are present in person, Mr. DiPaolo, Ms. Hess, and Ms. 

Loll are present via Zoom.  Mr. Wachter is present via Zoom.  Dr. Wood is present in person. 

 

 

APPROVAL OF THE AGENDA 

 

Mr. Cleaver makes a motion to approve the agenda.  Mr. DiPaolo seconds the motion.  There is no 

discussion of the agenda.  Motion carries 6-0. 

 

 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES – September 2022 

 

Mr. Cleaver makes a motion to accept the minutes as presented. Mr. DiPaolo seconds the motion.  

There is no discussion on the minutes.  Motion carries 6-0. 

 

 

DIRECTOR’S COMMENTS 

 

There are no comments by any Board member at this time. 
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COMMENTS BY THE CHAIR 

 

Mr. Barney has no comments at this time. 

 

 

PUBLIC COMMENT 

 

There is no public present for comments. 

 

 

PRESENTATIONS 

 

Dr. Wood:  There are no presentations scheduled for today, but the staff has been discussing the idea 

of having applicants for the entrepreneurship round come in.  The grant binders are done for that, the 

staff is almost done with our internal review.  As soon as we are done with that, we will provide the 

summaries for you.  I think since these grants are bigger grants, two and a half year grants, we 

definitely want to have some of these folks come in and present in front of the Board and have the 

Board ask questions and be able to interact.  We will get those summaries out to you soon. 

 We are also asking other funders to participate in this grant review so we are going to provide 

them with the summaries and see if we can get them on board with co-funding.  There are $2.7 M in 

requests here and we had budgeted about $1.2 M and there are a lot of good projects here.  So, we 

went to Erie Insurance, the Erie Community Foundation, and the DEI Commission and said that we 

would do the initial analysis, send it to them, and if they want to participate and figure out a way to 

loop their Boards in, we would involve each in the presentations.  I told them that the caveat was if the 

ECGRA Board objects, but I thought you would be amenable to working with other funders in the 

region. 

 

Mr. Barney:  That sounds good to me.  Are there any questions from anyone? 

 

 

COMMITTEE REPORTS 

 

a. Treasurer’s Report:  Mr. Cleaver:  Thank you, Mr. Chairman.  I reviewed the Treasurer’s 

Report with Dr. Wood and everything is fine.  I notice that we are underspent in every line item 

with the exception of auditors, but that is sort of a guess in the beginning of the year; you 

never know what they are going to throw at you.  Other than that, everything seems to be in 

order.  If anybody has any questions, I think we can answer them. 

I do want to make one comment.  I noticed that County Council a week or so ago voted 

down a request from the County Executive regarding the ARP monies that were earmarked for 

ECGRA to distribute.  That vote turned out 4-3 if I am aware, so we are back in the ballgame I 

believe.  Perry, do you have any comment about that? 

 

Dr. Wood:  We continue to follow it and stay in contact with members of County government 

about it.  I think it’s important that I tell everyone this – first and foremost we are supportive of 

Behrend and the plastics project between Gannon and Behrend; it’s a good, solid project.  I 

also tell everyone that I think $5 M is overkill for the project; not because it’s not a big-ticket 

item – it’s a $30 M item, but because typically big projects like that are funded by the State and 

Federal governments.  So, when you need to show local support, you don’t put in $5 M, you 

put in $500,000 and then you show the Feds and State the tremendous amount of local buy-in 
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you have with $500,000; you don’t use your entire basket of eggs.  That is an opinion I am 

giving after having been involved in these projects in the past.  And, of course, there is a bit of 

self-interest there; ECGRA is a good administrator of these dollars.   

That’s part of the message when I talk to members of County government, which is we 

fully support the project, it’s in the Playbook which we are a big supporter of, and we need to 

figure out a way to support them and get them to the $30 M level.  But using our local treasury 

for that, I think, is a strategic mistake.  At the end of the day, it would fund a great project, but if 

we don’t have those funds, we won’t be able to fulfill the demand of projects that you see in 

our rural listening report.  All of the projects that we cataloged there, there are a lot of 

boroughs and townships, like the City of Corry, that have given us a lot of amazing projects.  

These are once in a generational monies; we could do that for these rural areas.  That’s our 

government relations talking point. 

 

Mr. Cleaver:  So, it’s just a matter of wait and see as it plays out. 

 

Dr. Wood:  How it’s played out so far, and Tim and I have discussed this so Tim you can 

chime in.  We know that last year there was a vote for an ordinance that basically stated where 

the ARPA monies were at with the 2021 money, which was the current year they had it.  Then 

just like every new Administration, you have to rely on last year’s budget and everybody knows 

that’s County Council.  That is what they did with the ARPA funds.  Now the current Council is 

saying that they want to take a look at rejiggering those funds.  They decided to start with 

Transformative Grants, which is the bucket that we’ve been administering.  It went up for a 

vote to move the Transformative Grants from ECGRA to the plastics initiative; the vote failed 

4-3.  My understanding is parliamentary procedure of Administrative Code rule says that you 

can’t bring it up again for six months.  Carol and Whitey, you would know the procedure of this. 

 

Ms. Loll:  You can change the wording of it and bring it up again. 

 

Dr. Wood:  There you go.  Will it be brought up again?  We’ll have to wait and see.  But that is 

where we’re at. 

 

Mr. Cleaver:  I just figured I would make a comment on it because it was on the news and 

we’re sort of involved.  Just wanted to keep all the Board members up to snuff with what has 

transpired.  That’s all I have as far as the Treasurer’s Report. 

 

Mr. DiPaolo makes a motion to accept the Treasurer’s Report as presented.  Ms. Loll seconds 

the motion. There are no questions or discussion of the Treasurer’s Report. Motion carries 6-0. 

 

b. Strategic Planning Committee:  Dr. Wood:  There is nothing to report, but I did want to let you 

know that I think we will have to meet twice before our next Board meeting in November.  

There is going to be an opportunity to review both the entrepreneurial grants through 

presentations and then we will have our final round of Multi-Municipal Collaboration, 

Renaissance Block, and Anchor Building to review.  Those should be ready in November but if 

not, we can do it in December. 

 

c. Update from County Council:  Mr. Shank is not present to give a report.   

 

 

d. Update from County Executive’s Office:  Mr. Smith is not present to give a report. 
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REPORT OF THE EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR 

 

Dr. Wood:  The first thing you will see in the Director’s Report is the staff has been busy wrapping up 
the rural listening tour; you’ll see some advisories there of where we have been and who we have 
been talking to.  I have to say, we do this every two to three years and it is tremendously valuable.  
You get out there and meet with elected officials, business leaders, civic leaders and you hear directly 
from them how things are going.  Then if you saw that just yesterday, we were out in North East 
announcing funds for their Mission Main Street as well as their joint parks project.  Not only do they 
get to see that we came, listened to them, recognized the projects that were important to them and 
then we show back up with a check funding their grant application.  So, I think it’s a good relationship 
building strategy. 
          There are also some thank you letters in the Director’s Report from Octoberfest and Lake Erie 
Fanfare and then you will see a couple of instances where we were recognized on advertising 
material and then the ECGRA news clippings.  These are all great things for the archives. 
          I already mentioned that the entrepreneur monies are in the analysis phase.  Also, the facilities 
analysis RFP which Tom has been working on and that has come back; there were three people that 
bid on that.  Tom, why don’t you take a minute and update the Board on who the bids were and how 
we will decide, because we are going to bring these bids to you all for your discussion at the next 
Strategic Planning meeting. 
 
Mr. Maggio:  Thank you.  We received four proposals – one was a bit incomplete, and one was 
withdrawn after they submitted it.  So, we had two very solid proposals; one was Roth Marz 
Partnership who is very experienced in the matter, and then there was Weber, Murphy, Fox who also 
has impeccable credentials.  The apparent low bidder is Roth Marz and was well under where I 
thought we would be which is good news, but there is an issue with the reimbursable schedule so we 
will have to go over that again and try to get an estimate of where they would be.  I think that we’re 
still in a very good position.  Their bid was $84,750.00, which is significantly lower than I thought.     
          This is good news for the community centers and for us.  We will go over it a little more in detail 
and we will be able to present to the Board an opinion of who should get the contract.  We are on 
schedule with the timing because I would like to get this completed before these community centers 
apply for the community centers grant since they work hand-in-glove. 
          I think we are in good shape, and I’m pleased with the results so far and we’ll have that sorted 
out very soon. 
 
Dr. Wood:  Great.  Thank you, Tom.  Also on the horizon are Community Assets grants will be 
opening in December.  What is the schedule on Parks, Fields, and Trails Tom? 
 
Mr. Maggio:  That is due November 17th and we already have received some early applications.  
Typically, we do have a lot of applications for that program; this particular round is just for capital 
projects and not for programming but I think that there are a lot of people that are trying to complete 
some projects so we will have a full number of applications to review. 
 
Ms. Loll:  Back to the bids from Roth Marz and Weber, Murphy, Fox, do they have any percentage 
built-in for overrun? 
 
Mr. Maggio:  No.  We have a fixed cost contract. 
 
Ms. Loll:  For both of them? 
 
Mr. Maggio:  Yes.  Each of them have a different schedule for reimbursables; one just has copying as 
a reimbursable, which would be extra.  But that’s not a whole lot of money.  Then some have some 
testing which would be a reimbursable, which would be additional to the base bid.  But not every 
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community center is going to be doing testing, for say, asbestos or lead paint or something like that.  
It’s not too much of a concern but we have 17 community centers so I’m just trying to get a feel. 
          I will be talking to Bob Marz today hopefully and try to nail it down.  It could be that we agree to 
a ceiling so that we don’t exceed that amount either.  That’s a good question because that is very 
important. 
 
Ms. Loll:  That’s a good way of handling that because when they did the library, they forgot part of 
what needed to be done and so it cost another $70,000 more than what they bid so that was why I 
was wondering. 
Dr. Wood:  To round out the list, in November we will get a statement from the Community Foundation 
on where the Lead Asset Endowment is at and then we’ll make a recommendation to the Board for 
disbursement in December.  That will round out our calendar year. 
 
Mr. Barney:  Is Mr. Oberlander up to speed with how that all works? 
 
Dr. Wood:  We actually have a legal memo that we drafted at the time of establishing the endowment 
for perpetuity, so that guides our process.  That concludes my report.  Does anyone have any 
questions?  Thank you. 
 
 
SOLICITOR’S REPORT 

 
Mr. Wachter:  It’s been a slow month which is good for you.  Tom and I were just talking about 

coordinating on the creation of the agreement in order to have the architects do that work.  We will 

coordinate on that and get that out in a timely fashion and if you need anything, let me know. 

 

 

OLD BUSINESS 

 

There is no old business to discuss at this time. 

 

 

NEW BUSINESS 

 

There is no new business to discuss at this time, but Dr. Wood states that there will be a lot to 

approve at the next meeting. 

 

 

ADJOURNMENT 

 

Mr. Cleaver moves to adjourn.  Mr. Oberlander seconds the motion. 



 Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

 Profit & Loss

October 2022

October YTD Budget YTD 2022-23 YTD

Ordinary Income/Expense

Income

44800 · Gaming Revenue 1,560,788.70

44801 · Interactive Gaming Revenue 1,767,845.21

46400 · Other Types of Income

46410 · Interest Income - Savings 14,691.17 48,446.72

46422 ∙ Interest Income - BWC - Erie Growth 15,166.66

46424 · Interest Income - Progress Fund 5,000.00 15,000.00

46425 ∙ Interest Income - EDF Restruct 3,250.00 9,750.00

46426 · Interest Income - BWC - Inclusive 12,638.89

46427 · Interest Income - Blue Highway 14.31

46428 · Interest Income - eCAT 2,556.00 7,668.00

46510 ∙ Interest Income - YLI 50,590.80

Total Income 25,497.17 3,487,909.29

Expense

62100 · Contracted Services 3,617.84 38,938.35 42,000.00 72,000.00

62800 · Facilities & Equipment 1,429.49 13,748.40 16,331.00 28,000.00

65000 · Office Administration 1,718.28 9,331.84 10,472.00 17,950.00

65100 · Other Types of Expenses 5,006.95 19,236.77 27,825.00 47,700.00

65500 · PASCDU 1,169.54 3,513.22 8,897.00 15,250.00

66000 · Payroll Expenses 17,221.92 152,844.44 183,190.00 314,050.00

67000 · Building a Better Future (ARPA) 119,406.62 622,832.37 2,333,330.00 4,000,000.00

7000 · Provision for Uncollect Notes 0.00 12,800.00

Total Expense 149,570.64 873,245.39 2,622,045.00 4,494,950.00

Net Ordinary Income (124,073.47) 2,614,663.90

Other Income/Expense

70000 · Grants / Settlements / MRIs

70030 ∙ Community Assets (11,942.55)

70050 · Municipal Settlements 441,961.30 832,158.48

70070 ∙ Special Events 165,097.25

70090 ∙ Multi-Municipal Collaboration 133,328.00

70100 · Mission Main Street 103,000.00 335,256.18

70120 · Summer Jobs Program 53,867.10

70125 ∙ Neighborhoods & Communities MRI

70130 ∙ Small Business Financing 105,877.00

70140 · Pilot Projects

70150 · Shaping Tomorrow

70170 · Renaissance Block 120,000.00

70180 · Anchor Building 100,000.00

70190 · COVID-19 Immediate Human Relief

Total 70000 · Grants / Settlements 544,961.30 1,833,641.46

Net Other Income (544,961.30) (1,833,641.46)

Net Income (669,034.77) 781,022.44



 Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

 Balance Sheet
 As of October 31, 2022

October

ASSETS

Current Assets

Checking/Savings 294,007.59

10000 · ErieBank - Checking

10100 · ErieBank - Savings

10101 · Committed Funds 1,981,850.00

10102 · Restricted Funds 3,239,389.89

10104 · ARPA Fund 3,437,489.65

10100 · ErieBank - Savings - Other 8,438,790.04

Total 10100 · ErieBank - Savings 17,097,519.58

Total Checking/Savings 17,391,527.17

Other Current Assets

12000 · Notes Receivable

12003 · NR - CIBA 4,635.00

12004 · NR - BWC - Erie Growth 1,000,000.00

12005 · NR - Progress Fund 1,000,000.00

12010 · NR - 1855 Capital 500,000.00

12050 · NR - EDF Restructured 1,300,000.00

12060 · NR - BWC  - Inclusive Erie 2,500,000.00

12070 ∙ NR - Blue Highway 250,000.00

12080 · NR - BWC - Resp Fund Sm Bus 520,000.00

12085 · NR - BWC - Resp Fund Nnprofit 100,000.00

12090 ∙ NR - eCAT 500,000.00

12500 · NR - Youth Leadership Institute 188,000.00

12900 · Reserve for Uncollectable Notes (1,542,800.00)

Total 12000 · Notes Receivable 6,319,835.00

14500 · Prepaid Insurance 1,804.45

Total Other Current Assets 6,321,639.45

Total Current Assets 23,713,166.62

TOTAL ASSETS 23,713,166.62

LIABILITIES & EQUITY

Liabilities

Current Liabilities

20100* · Deferred Revenue (4,000,000.00)

20300 · Unerarned Revenue 7,989,488.00

Total Current Liabilities 3,989,488.00

Total Liabilities 3,989,488.00

Equity

30000 · Opening Balance Equity 2,927,064.18

32000 · Unrestricted Net Assets 16,015,592.00

Net Income 781,022.44

Total Equity 19,723,678.62

TOTAL LIABILITIES & EQUITY 23,713,166.62



 Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

 Budget vs. Actual

October 2022

October YTD Budget

Over/(Under) 

Budget % of Budget

Expense

62100 · Contracted Services

62110 · Accounting Fees 0.00 8,950.00 7,500.00 1,450.00 119.33%

62130 · Professional Services 3,000.00 21,000.00 40,000.00 (19,000.00) 52.50%

62140 · Legal Services 526.50 6,865.50 20,000.00 (13,134.50) 34.33%

62145 · Website Design 0.00 1,471.25 3,000.00 (1,528.75) 49.04%

62150 · Payroll Services 91.34 651.60 1,500.00 (848.40) 43.44%

Total 62100 · Contracted Services 3,617.84 38,938.35 72,000.00 (33,061.65) 54.08%

62800 · Facilities & Equipment

62840 · Office Equipment 56.99 4,263.90 10,000.00 (5,736.10) 42.64%

62890 · Rent 1,372.50 9,484.50 18,000.00 (8,515.50) 52.69%

Total 62800 · Facilities & Equipment 1,429.49 13,748.40 28,000.00 (14,251.60) 49.10%

65000 · Office Administration

65010 · Books, Subscriptions, Dues 65.00 2,607.88 3,000.00 (392.12) 86.93%

65020 · Postage 19.07 152.56 500.00 (347.44) 30.51%

65040 · Office Supplies 121.43 899.49 2,000.00 (1,100.51) 44.97%

65050 · Cell Phone 393.78 1,094.40 3,000.00 (1,905.60) 36.48%

65060 · Copier Lease 311.35 2,179.45 4,200.00 (2,020.55) 51.89%

65070 · Copier Printing Costs 0.00 3.70 500.00 (496.30) 0.74%

65080 · Bank Fees 35.00 305.00 500.00 (195.00) 61.00%

65085 · Professional Development 0.00 350.00 2,000.00 (1,650.00) 17.50%

65090 · Meeting Expenses 772.65 1,974.85 2,000.00 (25.15) 98.74%

65095 · Miscellaneous Expense 0.00 0.00 250.00 (250.00) 0.00%

Total 65000 · Office Administration 1,718.28 9,567.33 17,950.00 (8,382.67) 53.30%

65100 · Other Types of Expenses

65105 · Outreach 0.00 84.69 5,000.00 (4,915.31) 1.69%

65110 · Advertising 0.00 201.67 4,000.00 (3,798.33) 5.04%

65115 · Phone/IT/Fax 949.09 9,447.04 18,000.00 (8,552.96) 52.48%

65120 · Insurance 879.67 6,157.69 10,200.00 (4,042.31) 60.37%

65130 ∙ Grant Management Software 2,575.00 2,575.00 5,500.00 (2,925.00) 46.82%

65150 · Travel 603.19 890.30 5,000.00 (4,109.70) 17.81%

Total 65100 · Other Types of Expenses 5,006.95 19,356.39 47,700.00 (28,343.61) 40.58%

65500 · PASCDU 1,169.54 3,513.22 15,250.00 (11,736.78) 23.04%

66000 · Payroll Expenses

66005 · Salaries & Wages 14,420.66 129,035.88 276,400.00 (147,364.12) 46.68%

66010 · FITW Tax 1,369.30 11,135.71 17,400.00 (6,264.29) 64.00%

66015 · FUTA Tax 0.00 0.00 150.00 (150.00) 0.00%

66020 · PASUI Tax 0.00 0.00 2,000.00 (2,000.00) 0.00%

66700 ∙ PMRS 1,431.96 12,672.85 18,100.00 (5,427.15) 70.02%

Total 66000 · Payroll Expenses 17,221.92 152,844.44 314,050.00 (161,205.56) 48.67%

67000 · Building a Better Future (ARPA)

67005 · Contracted Services - ARPA 441.00 4,263.00 273,274.00 (269,011.00) 1.56%

67010 · Subawards - ARPA 112,500.00 576,471.99 3,622,025.00 (3,045,553.01) 15.92%

67025 · Indirect Costs - ARPA 272.54 1,894.12 11,295.00 (9,400.88) 16.77%

67030 · Salaries & Wages - ARPA 6,193.08 40,203.26 93,406.00 (53,202.74) 43.04%

Total 67000 · Building a Better Future (ARPA) 119,406.62 622,832.37 4,000,000.00 (3,377,167.63) 77.29%

7000 · Provision for Uncollect Notes 0.00 12,800.00 12,800.00 0.00 100.00%

Total Expense 149,570.64 873,600.50 4,507,750.00 (3,634,149.50) 19.38%



Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

Schedule of Grant Reserve
as of 

October 31, 2022

October YTD Totals/Subtotals

Restricted Uncommitted Funds 3,239,389.89

Committed Funds 1,981,850.00

ARPA Funds

2022 Restricted Funds: (75% - after settlement payments)

First Quarter Gaming Revenue 245,818.17

Second Quarter Gaming Revenue 924,773.35

Third Quarter Gaming Revenue 

Fourth Quarter Gaming Revenue 1,170,591.52

2022 Interactive Gaming Revenue

FY 2021-2022 1,767,845.21 1,767,845.21

FY Disbursements:

First Quarter Disbursements 776,260.31

Second Quarter Disbursements 1,047,811.78

Third Quarter Disbursements 544,961.30 544,961.30

Fourth Quarter Disbursements 2,369,033.39

Grants/Settlements

October YTD Subtotal

COMMUNITY ENTERPRISE FINANCING LOAN

MUNICIPALITIES

    Settlements

Summit Township 198,882.60 374,471.33

Greene Township 48,615.74 91,537.43

McKean Township 48,615.74 91,537.43

Millcreek Township 48,615.74 91,537.43

Waterford Township 48,615.74 91,537.43

Erie County 48,615.74 91,537.43

832,158.48

     Multi-Municipal Collaboration

2022 Edinboro Community & Economic Development 50,000.00

Erie Area Council of Governments 50,000.00

Jefferson Educational Society 100,000.00

200,000.00

Disbursements Detail



Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

Schedule of Grant Reserve
as of 

October 31, 2022

October YTD Subtotal

NEIGHBORHOODS & COMMUNITIES

     Anchor Building

2018 Emmaus Ministries, Inc. 5,000.00

Performing Artists Collective Alliance 5,000.00

2019 Housing & Neighborhood Development 40,000.00

2021 Performing Artists Collective Alliance 50,000.00

100,000.00

     Mission Main Street

2018 Erie Downtown Partnership 134,108.00

2019 Borough of North East 110,000.00

Preservation Erie (8,185.82)

SSJ Neighborhood Network 55,500.00

2020 Borough of Girard 45,000.00

Impact Corry 28,000.00 28,000.00

2022 Downtown Girard 75,000.00 75,000.00

Downtown North East 87,500.00

Edinboro Community & Economic Development 37,500.00 62,500.00

Erie Center for Arts & Technology (37,500.00) 25,000.00

614,422.18

     Renaissance Block

2020 Borough of North East 30,000.00

2021 Borough of Union City 50,000.00

2021 Impact Corry 40,000.00

2022 Borough of Union City 100,000.00

Our West Bayfront 50,000.00

270,000.00

PILOT PROGRAMS

QUALITY OF PLACE

     Community Assets

2018 Harborcreek Township (11,942.55)

(11,942.55)

     Special Events

Albion Area Fair, Inc. 9,560.40

Asbury Woods Partnership 1,855.16

Borough of Edinboro 1,315.95

Borough of Wesleyville 781.53

CAFE 16,507.50

Crime Victim Center of Erie County, Inc, 2,504.22

Downtown North East 2,979.26

Edinboro Arts & Music Festival 3,022.50

Erie Contemporary Ballet Theatre 5,068.04



Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

Schedule of Grant Reserve
as of 

October 31, 2022

October YTD Subtotal

     Special Events (cont.)

Erie Downtown Partnership 6,300.75

Erie Homes for Children and Adults 930.70

Erie Regional Chamber & Growth Partner. 4,650.00

Erie-Western PA Port Authority 6,165.46

Film Society of NWPA 6,863.40

Fort LeBoeuf Historical Society 841.65

Goodell Gardens & Homestead 1,655.40

Harborcreek Township 1,162.50

Holy Trinity RC Church 6,347.25

Humane Society of NWPA 4,650.00

Impact Corry 1,148.55

Iroquois School District Foundation 1,962.30

Jefferson Educational Society of Erie 20,000.00

Lake Erie Fanfare 4,394.25

Lake Erie Greek Cultural Society 7,440.00

Mercy Center For Women 910.24

Nonprofit Partnership, The 3,514.24

Presque Isle Light Station 576.60

Presque Isle Partnership 4,008.30

Saint Joseph Church 6,783.19

SSJ Neighborhood Network 4,726.61

Union City Pride, Inc. 1,209.00

Waterford Community Fair Association 7,851.76

Wattsburg Agricultural Society 10,481.57

YMCA of Greater Erie 1,422.90

Young Artists Debut Orchestra 4,201.74

Youth Leadership Institute of Erie 1,304.33

165,097.25

SHAPING TOMORROW

SMALL BUSINESS FINANCING

     Beehive Network

Erie Regional Library Foundation 5,877.00

Penn State University 100,000.00

     Community Enterprise Financing Loan
Youth Leadership Institute of Erie 63,920.00

169,797.00

YOUTH & EDUCATION

     Summer Jobs & More 134,501.09

134,501.09

Total Funds Disbursements 544,961.30 2,474,033.45 2,474,033.45



Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority

Schedule of Grant Reserve
as of 

October 31, 2022

October
Amount 

Remaining

Original 

Commitment

Committed Funds:

N&C Renaissance Block 2018

1     Academy Neighborhood Association 11,250.00 22,500.00

      SSJ Neighborhood Network 7,000.00 70,000.00

2     Bayfront Eastside Taskforce 25,000.00 50,000.00

      ServErie 29,000.00 58,000.00

Renaissance Block 2022

     Our West Bayfront 50,000.00 100,000.00

Anchor Building

19     Impact Corry 60,000.00 75,000.00

20    Borough of Union City 15,000.00 64,375.00

Mission Main Street

1      City of Erie 225,000.00 250,000.00

3      Impact Corry 28,000.00 0.00 202,400.00

       Waterford Borough 84,600.00 249,800.00

Mission Main Street 2022

     Downtown Girard 75,000.00 75,000.00 150,000.00

     Downtown North East 87,500.00 175,000.00

     Edinboro Community & Economic Development 37,500.00 62,500.00 125,000.00

    Erie Center for Arts & Technology -37,500.00 0.00 25,000.00

MUN Multi-Municipal Collaboration

21   Borough of North East 50,000.00 100,000.00

SB Beehive Network

Community Enterprise Financing Loan

PP Pilot Program

QP Response Fund (COVID)

Small Business 680,000.00 1,200,000.00

Non-Profit 300,000.00 400,000.00

Y&E Shaping Tomorrow

     Empower Erie - Community College 220,000.00 400,000.00

Total Committed Funds 103,000.00 1,981,850.00 3,717,075.00

ARPA Transformative Funds

Subawards 112,500.00 3,116,387.01 3,622,025.00

Contracted Services 441.00 262,261.00 273,274.00

Salaries & Wages 6,193.08 49,706.47 93,406.00

Indirect Costs 272.54 9,135.17 11,295.00

119,406.62 3,437,489.65 4,000,000.00

Total ARPA Funds









































RESOLUTION NUMBER 13, 2022 

Resolution to enter into a contract with Roth Marz Partnership to provide building inspections 

 as described in the Erie County Community Facility Assessment  

Request for Proposal 
 

BE IT RESOLVED that, ECGRA, in the implementation of its mission to promote economic and 

community development in partnership with federal agencies, the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, and 

other entities in national and state government, the board of directors of the Erie County Gaming 

Revenue Authority, pursuant to the Economic Development Financing Law and the Erie County Gaming 

Revenue Authority Bylaws, resolves to enter into a contract with Roth Marz Partnership not to exceed 

$84,750 to provide seventeen (17) building inspections as described in the Erie County Community 

Facility Assessment Request for Proposal (RFP). 

 

One the motion of ____________________________, seconded by ___________________________. 

This resolution was passed on the 17th day of November 2022 by a vote of ________ - ________. 

 

ERIE COUNTY GAMING REVENUE AUTHORITY 

 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
Chairman, Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority 

November 17, 2022 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Secretary, ECGRA 
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ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS: 
The author of this document has 
added information needed for its 
completion. The author may also 
have revised the text of the original 
AIA standard form. An Additions and 
Deletions Report that notes added 
information as well as revisions to the 
standard form text is available from 
the author and should be reviewed. A 
vertical line in the left margin of this 
document indicates where the author 
has added necessary information 
and where the author has added to or 
deleted from the original AIA text.

This document has important legal 
consequences. Consultation with an 
attorney is encouraged with respect 
to its completion or modification.

AGREEMENT made as of the First   day of November  in the year Two Thousand 
Twenty-two  
(In words, indicate day, month and year.)

BETWEEN the Owner:
(Name, legal status, address and other information)

Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority   
5340 Fryling Road  
Erie, Pennsylvania 16510
Telephone Number: 814-897-2694

and the Architect:
(Name, legal status, address and other information)

Roth Marz Partnership P.C.  
3505 Chapin Street  
Erie, Pennsylvania 16508
Telephone Number: 814-860-8366

for the following Project:
(Name, location and detailed description)

Inspection and Assessment of 17 Community Centers (Please see attached list)
  
  

The Owner and Architect agree as follows.

GOALS 
In order to maintain the safety and efficiency of their buildings, offer high quality services 
to their clients, and structure the needed financing, ECGRA seeks to assist the centers with 
the development of a ten-year capital improvement plan for the participating Community 
Centers. This project will include: 

 Identification of conditions in terms of deferred maintenance and building 
condition. 

 Identification of issues related to compliance with any federal requirements such 
as the Americans with Disabilities Act, any specific regulations for child-care 
facilities, and environmental issues. 

 Creation of a clear and concise capital improvement plan with an analysis of 
current conditions and other plans community centers may have. This includes the 
provision of cost estimates and recommended prioritization for the above items. 

 Identification and brief description of modifications that would better emulate 
best practices for child-care facilities, especially pandemic related projects. 
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SCOPE OF WORK 
The scope of work includes a thorough assessment of the building and exterior property and a final report. 

Inspection and Assessment 
Consultant will visually inspect facilities and properties. Inspections shall be conducted using applicable codes and 
accepted industry standards. Specifically, the assessment will focus on the following components: 

 Site structure. Provide a description of the building structure such as materials used in construction including 
the foundation, floors, walls, windows, and roof, etc. 

 General building systems. Provide a description of building systems noting any visible deficiencies. 
 Mechanical/electrical systems/HVAC. Provide information regarding the electrical service going into the 

building (i.e. overhead or underground). The HVAC system should be described and include data on the 
equipment’s specific location, age and life expectancy, and condition. It should be noted if the system is 
adequate for heating/cooling air distribution. The assessment should include information regarding 
ventilation. 

 Plumbing. Assessment should detail the condition and note any deficiencies in the plumbing systems for the 
building. 

 Life/Safety/Fire Protection. The consultant will report any immediate life and/or property safety issues upon 
discovery separately from the overall building report. 

 Infrastructure. Provide assessment of all infrastructure exterior to the building to include parking lots, 
playground surface and equipment, drainage, sidewalks. 

 Americans with Disabilities (ADA). Review building for compliance with the most recent ADA accessibility 
standards noting areas of non-compliance. If areas of obvious non- compliance are noted, include costs to 
create compliance. 

 COVID-19. Assess building for mold and excess moisture. Additionally, identify modifications or 
enhancements that could be made to the building to maximize health and safety related to the transmission of 
communicable diseases. 

 Lifecycle. Provide lifecycle data on components listed above including estimated life remaining, and cost to 
repair or replace at conclusion of life. 

FINAL REPORT 
A final report that includes:

 A general description of the property, including the condition, for the items identified for Inspection and 
Assessment. 

 A description of components that are or will be in need of maintenance over the next ten years based on 
observed conditions, available maintenance history and industry- standard useful life estimates. 

 A prioritized ten-year schedule for recommended replacement or repairs and a summary of improvement 
options. 

 Cost estimates based on a standardized, nationally recognized, cost estimating system. 
 A summary of other needed improvements that would improve service delivery at the facility and estimated 

cost. 
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ARTICLE 1   ARCHITECT’S RESPONSIBILITIES
The Architect shall provide architectural services for the Project as described in this Agreement. The Architect shall 
perform its services consistent with the professional skill and care ordinarily provided by architects practicing in the 
same or similar locality under the same or similar circumstances. The Architect shall perform its services as 
expeditiously as is consistent with such professional skill and care and the orderly progress of the Project. The 
Architect shall assist the Owner in determining consulting services required for the Project. The Architect’s services 
include the following consulting services, if any:

(Paragraphs deleted)Mechanical, electrical, and plumbing engineering services.   

ARTICLE 2   OWNER’S RESPONSIBILITIES
The Owner shall provide drawings and maintenance history of the building existing conditions. The Owner shall 
furnish required information as expeditiously as necessary for the orderly progress of the Project. The Architect shall 
be entitled to rely on the accuracy and completeness of the Owner’s information. The Owner shall furnish consulting 
services not provided by the Architect, but required for the Project, such as surveying, which shall include property 
boundaries, topography, utilities, and wetlands information; geotechnical engineering; and environmental testing 
services, if required.

ARTICLE 3   USE OF DOCUMENTS
Drawings, specifications and other documents prepared by the Architect are the Architect’s Instruments of Service, 
and are for the Owner’s use solely with respect to constructing the Project. The Architect shall retain all common law, 
statutory and other reserved rights, including the copyright. Upon completion of the construction of the Project, 
provided that the Owner substantially performs its obligations under this Agreement, the Architect grants to the Owner 
a license to use the Architect’s Instruments of Service as a reference for maintaining, altering and adding to the 
Project. The Owner agrees to indemnify the Architect from all costs and expenses related to claims arising from the 
Owner’s use of the Instruments of Service without retaining the Architect. When transmitting copyright-protected 
information for use on the Project, the transmitting party represents that it is either the copyright owner of the 
information, or has permission from the copyright owner to transmit the information for its use on the Project.

ARTICLE 4   TERMINATION, SUSPENSION OR ABANDONMENT
In the event of termination, suspension or abandonment of the Project by the Owner, the Architect shall be 
compensated for services performed. The Owner’s failure to make payments in accordance with this Agreement shall 
be considered substantial nonperformance and sufficient cause for the Architect to suspend or terminate services. 
Either the Architect or the Owner may terminate this Agreement after giving no less than seven days’ written notice if 
the Project is suspended for more than 90 days, or if the other party substantially fails to perform in accordance with 
the terms of this Agreement. Except as otherwise expressly provided herein, this Agreement shall terminate one year 
from the date of Substantial Completion.

ARTICLE 5   MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS
This Agreement shall be governed by the law of the place where the Project is located. Terms in this Agreement shall 
have the same meaning as those in AIA Document A105–2017, Standard Short Form of Agreement Between Owner 
and Contractor. Neither party to this Agreement shall assign the contract as a whole without written consent of the 
other.

Nothing contained in this Agreement shall create a contractual relationship with, or a cause of action in favor of, a 
third party against either the Owner or the Architect.

The Architect shall have no responsibility for the discovery, presence, handling, removal or disposal of, or exposure of 
persons to, hazardous materials or toxic substances in any form at the Project site.

ARTICLE 6   PAYMENTS AND COMPENSATION TO THE ARCHITECT
The Architect’s Compensation shall be:

$84,750.00  
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The Owner shall pay the Architect an initial payment of zero   ($ 0.00   ) as a minimum payment under this Agreement. 
The initial payment shall be credited to the final invoice.

The Owner shall reimburse the Architect for expenses incurred in the interest of the Project, plus ten   percent (   10 %).

Payments are due and payable upon receipt of the Architect’s monthly invoice. Amounts unpaid  forty-five  ( 45  ) days 
after the invoice date shall bear interest from the date payment is due at the rate of  .5 % per month, or in the absence 
thereof, at the legal rate prevailing at the principal place of business of the Architect.

ARTICLE 7   OTHER PROVISIONS
(Insert descriptions of other services and modifications to the terms of this Agreement.)

Roth Marz Partnership P.C. has not included the following services in the basic compensation:   

1. Environmental surveys/testing including but not limited to mold, asbestos, lead paint, storage tanks, 
contaminated soil, etc. 

2. Testing of existing mechanical systems/components. 
3. Camera investigation of plumbing systems. 
4. Structural testing/monitoring. 
5. Measure and creating existing drawings/floor plans of any buildings (RMP assumes each of the community 

centers have drawings of their facilities). 
6. Geotechnical testing/concrete coring and roof coring. 

These services if needed can be provided via a cost plus 10%

This Agreement entered into as of the day and year first written above.

    
OWNER (Signature) ARCHITECT (Signature)

    Mr. Robert L. Marz, AIA   President 
(Printed name and title) (Printed name, title, and license number, if required)



Community Center Address City ST ZIP SF Contact Email Contact 
                

Benedictine Sisters Campus 330 East 10th St. Erie PA 16501     42,896  nsabol@stben.org Nancy Sabol 
InnerCity Neighborhood Art House 201 East 10th St Erie PA 16501      8,500  kstolar@neighborhoodarthouse.org Kelly Stolar 

St. Mary's School & Auditorium 345 East 9th Erie PA 16503     30,796  mkloecker@emmauserie.org Margaret Kloecker 
Boys and Girls Club 1515 East Lake Road Erie PA 16511     45,000  messina1895@gmail.com Al Messina 

YMCA Erie 31 West 10th Street Erie PA 16501     43,709  gvandemerwe@ymcaerie.org Gary Vandemerwe 
Martin Luther King Center 312 Chestnut St. Erie PA 16507     34,364  jsherrod@mlkcentererie.org James Sherrod 

YMCA Corry 906 North Center Street Corry PA 16407     32,000  edwardobrien.ymcaofcorry@gmail.com Ed O'Brien 
John F. Kennedy Center 2021 East 20th Street Erie PA 16510     31,030  shudsonbrewton@thejfkcenter.org Samella Hudson-Brewton 
Booker T. Washington 1720 Holland Street Erie PA 16503     29,000  shilliard@btwcenter.org Shantel Hilliard 

Saint Martin Center 1701 Parade Street Erie PA 16503     28,000  dgonzalez@stmartincenter.org David Gonzalez 
Mercy Center for Women 1039 East 27th Street Erie PA 16504     25,000  jhagerty@mcwerie.org Jennie Haggerty 
Bethany Outreach Center 254 East 10th Street Erie PA 16503     25,000  mabel@bethanyoutreachcenter.org Mable Howard 

Multi-Cultural Resource Center 554 East 10th Street Erie PA 16503     23,559  kkretz@mcrcerie.org Katie Kretz 
Corry Hi-Ed 221 North Center Street Corry PA 16407     22,524  bhoward@corryhied.org Brody Howard 

International Institute 517 East 26th Street Erie PA 16504     12,570  djackson@uscri-erie.org Dylanna Greisenger 
Eagle's Nest 1129 Pennsylvania Avenue Erie PA 16503      6,500  oljackson@hotmail.com Onjanette Jackson 

Community Shelter Services 655 West 16th Street Erie PA 16502     71,000  kconfer@communityshelter.org Katie Confer 
 
 
 
 
 
 



RESOLUTION NUMBER 14, 2022 

 Resolution to enter into agreement with two (2) recipients of Small Business 

Ecosystem grant program totaling $350,000 for the purpose of strengthening 

the small business community in the wake of the COVID-19 pandemic 

 

Whereas, the Economic Development Financing Law states that “a 

minimum level of unemployment and maximum level of business opportunity, 

and the elimination or prevention of blight can best be provided by the 

promotion, attraction, stimulation, rehabilitation and revitalization of industry, 

commerce and other activities in the Commonwealth”; and, 

Whereas, the Economic Development Financing Law expressly states 

that entities like ECGRA have as a purpose to “promote industrial, commercial 

and other economic development”; and, 

Whereas, ECGRA has been appointed by County Council as a 

Subrecipient to administer American Rescue Plan Act (ARPA) funding for the 

purposes of building entrepreneurial opportunities for small businesses; and, 

Whereas, ECGRA established the Small Business Ecosystem grant 

program in response to County Council’s request in accordance with guidance 

from the ARPA guidelines; and, 

Whereas, those grant applicants are hereby identified as Bridgeway 

Capital, a community development financing institution, and the U.S. 

Committee for Refugees and Immigrants, formerly the International Institute of 

Erie, a refugee resettlement agency (USCRI); and, 

Whereas, through the ARPA funding provided by ECGRA, Bridgeway 

Capital and USCRI will provide technical assistance to small businesses and 

small business entrepreneurs who were negatively impacted by the COVID-19 

pandemic, and  

Whereas, to further leverage the ARPA funding, ECGRA shall also provide 

funding to grant applicants through non-federally sourced capital which would 

include a revolving loan fund focused on the same category of small businesses 

and small business entrepreneurs. 

 

 

 



NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Erie 

County Gaming Revenue Authority, pursuant to the Economic Development 

Financing Law and the ECGRA Bylaws, awards grants totaling $350,000 to the 

extent outlined in the attached Exhibit “A”. 

 

On the motion of ________________________, seconded by __________________. 
 
 
This resolution was passed on the 17th day of November 2022 by a vote of ____-
_____. 
 
 
 

ERIE COUNTY GAMING REVENUE AUTHORITY 
 
 
 

------------------------------------------------------------------ 
Chairman, Erie County Gaming Revenue Authority 

November 17, 2022 
 

ATTEST: 
 
 
______________________ 
Secretary, ECGRA 
 



Organization Project Name

Amount 

Awarded

Bridgeway Capital (re)Making Erie $200,000.00 

International Institute of Erie 

(USCRI) R3 Revolving Loan Fund $150,000.00

TOTAL $350,000.00

Building a Better Future

Entrepreneur & Small Business

ROUND 1
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